
 

 

Freedom of Information Team 
Criminal Justice Inspection Northern Ireland  
Block 1, Knockview Buildings, 
Stormont Estate 
Belfast 
BT4 3SJ 
 

 
 
10 May 2024 
Reference: 070524/054 
 
RE: FOI Request for information regarding our organisation’s ICT equipment and 
services 
 
Dear , 
 
Thank you for your recent Freedom of Information request received via email to 
Criminal Justice Inspection Northern Ireland (CJI) on 7 May 2024.  In your email you 
requested information regarding our organisation’s ICT equipment and services in a 
template you provided. 
 
In respect of your request, our understanding of the information you requested (as 
stated in your template) is as follows: 

1. List the number of devices deployed by your organisation (device type): 
Desktop PCs, laptops, mobile phones, printers, MFDs, tablets, physical 
services, storage devices, networking infrastructure and security 
infrastructure. 

2. Know the plans for procuring any of the detailed enterprise applications or 
software and the budget allocated for them during the 2024/25 and 2025/26 
periods. These services being: Content Management System, Supply Chain 
Management (SCM), Inventory Management Software, Enterprise Asset 
Management (EAM) Software, Business intelligence Systems and other 
software or apps.  

3. Know the plans for procuring specific End-user devices and the budget 
allocated for them during the 2024-25 and 2025-26 periods. These devices 
include desktops, laptops, mobile phones, tablets, and others. 

4. Know the plans for procuring any of the detailed services/softwares and the 
budget allocated for them during the 2024-25 and 2025-26 periods. These 
services being: Artificial Intelligence (AI) and Cyber Security.  

 



 

 

In response to your request, I can advise that the details included in the attached 
template which you provided (Appendix A) and the information below in this reply is 
being released in response to your request. 
Question 1: Please see information contained in Appendix A.  Where we do not hold 
the provide the information you have requested, you may wish to contact Enterprise 
Shared Services within the Northern Ireland Civil Service who provide CJI’s 
Information and Computer Technology. 
 
Questions 2: Please see information contained in Appendix A. As CJI’s Information 
and Computer Technology is provided by Enterprise Shared Services within the 
Northern Ireland Civil Service we do not hold the information you have requested. 
 
Question 3: At the time this response has been provided the 2024-25 and 2025-26 
budget allocation for CJI is unknown and budget profiling has not occurred. As CJI’s 
Information and Computer Technology is provided by Enterprise Shared Services 
within the Northern Ireland Civil Service we do not hold some the information you 
have requested.  Where information is held by CJI please see the response provided 
in Appendix A. 
 
Question 4: Please see information contained In Appendix A. As CJI’s Information and 
Computer Technology is provided by Enterprise Shared Services within the Northern 
Ireland Civil Service we do not hold the information you have requested. 
 
 
The Enterprise Shared Services Freedom of Information Team can be contacted on 
(ess.freedomofinformation@finance-ni.gov.uk).   
 
I hope this information satisfies your request.  Should this not satisfy your request for 
information, please contact in the first instance CJI’s Freedom of Information Team.  
Their address is Freedom of Information Team, Criminal Justice Inspection Northern 
Ireland, Block 1, Knockview Buildings, Belfast BT4 3SJ or email info@cjini.org 
 
Your sincerely,  

James Corrigan 
Chief Executive  
Criminal Justice Inspection Northern Ireland 
 
Enc: Appendix A - Completed Table 
 



Device Type Number of Devices
Desktop PCs 0
Laptops 11
Mobile Phones 10
Printers 7
Multi Functional Devices (MFDs) 1
Tablets 1

Physical Servers This information is not held by CJI.

Storage Devices (for example: NAS, SAN) This information is not held by CJI.

Networking Infrastructure (for example: Switches, Routers, Interfaces, Wireless Access Points) This information is not held by CJI.

Security Infrastructure (for example: Firewalls, Intrusion Detection Systems (IDS), Virus Monitoring 
Tools)

This information is not held by CJI.

Q2. Does your organisation plan to procure any of the below enterprise applications or software, if 
yes, please provide information in the below format. 

Please note, if the applications you're planning to procure are not listed below then do mention 
them separately.

2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000) 2025/26 Spend/Budget (£000) 

Content Management System
This information is not held by CJI.

This information is not held by 
CJI.

Supply Chain Management (SCM)
This information is not held by CJI.

This information is not held by 
CJI.

Inventory Management Software
This information is not held by CJI.

This information is not held by 
CJI.

Enterprise Asset Management (EAM) Software 
This information is not held by CJI.

This information is not held by 
CJI.

Business Intelligence Systems
This information is not held by CJI.

This information is not held by 
CJI.

Other software/apps (mention the name of the software)
This information is not held by CJI.

This information is not held by 
CJI.

Q3. Do you have any plans to procure End user devices (desktop/laptop/tablet/mobile phones etc)? 
if yes, please provide information in the below format.

2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000) 2025/26 Spend/Budget (£000) 

Desktops No No
Laptops No No

Mobile Phones

CJI's 2024-25 budget is unknown at  
this time therefore monies to fund 
the replacement of mobile devices 
in-year has not been allocated.

CJI's 2025-26 budget is unknown 
at this time therefore monies to 
fund the replacemetn of mobile 
devices in-year has not been 
allocated.

Tablets and Others (if Others, please specify) No No

Q4. Do you have any plans to procure below services/softwares? if yes, please provide information 
in the below format. 

2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000) 2025/26 Spend/Budget (£000) 

Artificial Intelligence (AI) This information is not held by CJI.
This information is not held by 
CJI.

Cyber Security This information is not held by CJI.
This information is not held by 
CJI.

Q1. Can you please list the number of devices deployed by your organisation for the following?
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